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Bid Awarded To:
Date:

Invitation Number/|

CITY OF DANVILLE

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

INVITATION TO BID/QUOTATIONS - SUMMARY

May 7, 2025

IFB 24-25-102

Purchase Order:
Department:

Person

PO Box 3300
Danville, Virginia 24543
Phone # 434-799-6528

Water Treatment Plant

Alan Johnson

Title: Water Treatment Chemicals Completing Forn Carrie Conner

Brenntag Mid-South Inc C&S Chemical Carus Corporation Chemrite Incorporated Chemtrade Chemicals
Item | Quantity| Unit Description Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
219 TN Aluminum Sulfate (liquid Alum) No Bid No Bid $508.75 $111,416.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $290.00 $63,510.00

500 LB Aluminum Sulfate (Dry) $0.4914 $245.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

100 LB Calcium Hypochlorite $2.3000 $230.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

300 GL Antiscalant No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.286 $3,385.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

50 TN Hydrated Lime No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4500 GL Hydrofluosilicic Acid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4500 GL Caustic Soda - Liquid $2.3700 $10,665.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




8 24 TN Chlorine - Liquid ( Ton Cylinders) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 2500 LB Chlorine - Liquid (150 Ib. Cylinders) $1.4400 $3,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 8000 LB Potassium Permanganate $2.5000 $20,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.26 $18,080.00 No Bid No Bid
11 8000 LB Powered Activated Carbon $1.3220 $10,576.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.38 $11,040.00 No Bid No Bid
12 300 GL Sodium Bisulfite $4.4000 $1,320.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 2300 GL Sodium Hypochlorite $5.1000 $11,730.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 | 4500 GL Corrosion Inhinitor $6.9500 $31,275.00 No Bid No Bid $6.077 $27,346.50 $10.14 $45,630.00 No Bid No Bid
Total $89,641.70 111,416.25 $30,732.30 $74,750.00 $63,510.00
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Bid Awarded To: Purchase Order:

Date: May 7, 2025 Department: Water Treatment Plant

Invitation Number/| IFB 24-25-102 Person Alan Johnson

Title: Water Treatment Chemicals Completing Forn Carrie Conner

Eco Solutions Distributing George S. Coyne Chemical JCI Chemicals Lh?'s.t r:lorth America of Pennco Inc
Company Inc Virginia Incorporated
Item | Quantity| Unit Description Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

1 219 TN Aluminum Sulfate (liquid Alum) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 500 LB Aluminum Sulfate (Dry) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 100 LB Calcium Hypochlorite No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 300 GL Antiscalant No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 50 TN Hydrated Lime No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $414.06 $20,703.00 No Bid No Bid
6 4500 GL Hydrofluosilicic Acid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.48 $11,160.00
7 4500 GL Caustic Soda - Liquid $2.84 $12,780.00 No Bid No Bid $770.00 $23,100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




8 24 TN Chlorine - Liquid ( Ton Cylinders) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.8000 $67,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 2500 LB Chlorine - Liquid (150 Ib. Cylinders) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.8666 $4,666.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 8000 LB Potassium Permanganate No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 8000 LB Powered Activated Carbon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 300 GL Sodium Bisulfite No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 2300 GL Sodium Hypochlorite No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 4500 GL Corrosion Inhinitor No Bid No Bid $5.4836 $ 24,676.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total $12,780.00 $ 24,676.20 $94,966.50 $20,703.00 $11,160.00




\,E V;
N
N 4>c,\
3 z
(=] >

HOME

Bid Awarded To:

Date:

Invitation Number/|

CITY OF DANVILLE
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
INVITATION TO BID/QUOTATIONS - SUMMARY

May 7, 2025

IFB 24-25-102

PO Box 3300
Danville, Virginia 24543
Phone # 434-799-6528

Purchase Order:

Department:

Person

Water Treatment Plant

Alan Johnson

Title: Water Treatment Chemicals Completing Forn Carrie Conner
Rhule LLC Shannon Chemical Corporation Univar Solutions USA Inc Water Guard
Item | Quantity| Unit Description Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
1 219 TN Aluminum Sulfate (liquid Alum) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $419.00 $91,761.00 No Bid No Bid
2 500 LB Aluminum Sulfate (Dry) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 100 LB Calcium Hypochlorite No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 300 GL Antiscalant No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 50 TN Hydrated Lime No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 4500 GL Hydrofluosilicic Acid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.45 $11,025.00 No Bid No Bid
7 4500 GL Caustic Soda - Liquid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.72 $12,240.00 No Bid No Bid




8 24 TN Chlorine - Liquid ( Ton Cylinders) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 2500 LB Chlorine - Liquid (150 Ib. Cylinders) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 8000 LB Potassium Permanganate $2.66 $21,280.00 $2.47 $19,760.00 $2.32 $18,560.00 No Bid No Bid
11 8000 LB Powered Activated Carbon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.10 $8,800.00 No Bid No Bid
12 300 GL Sodium Bisulfite No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.21 $1,263.00 $4.15 $1,245.00
13 2300 GL Sodium Hypochlorite No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.10 $11,730.00 $5.00 $11,500.00
14 4500 GL Corrosion Inhinitor No Bid No Bid $6.47 $29,115.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total $21,280.00 $48,875.00 $155,379.00 $12,745.00
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